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For Chinese companies going pXblic, the calcXlXs oYer Zhere to sell their shares 
has become increasingl\ mXrk\, as trade tensions betZeen the US and China 
haYe appeared to deter them from US e[changes. 

TikTok oZner B\teDance and artificial intelligence heaY\Zeight SenseTime are 
both considering IPOs in their home coXntr\, according to ReXters. B\teDance is 
also reportedl\ Zeighing a Hong Kong listing. 

Reports of the potential listings in China folloZ Ant GroXp's recent decision to 
pXrsXe a dXal listing in Hong Kong and Shanghai, rather than go pXblic on a US 
e[change. And earlier this month, Chinese chipmaking giant SMIC raised $6.5 
billion on the STAR market in Shanghai. 

The string of Xpcoming offerings in China adds more credibilit\ to Shanghai¶s 
\ear-old STAR market, Zhich has listed more IPOs this \ear than either the NeZ 
York Stock E[change or Nasdaq, as of JXl\ 20, according to The Economist. 

Chinese e[changes haYe become more attractiYe as the\ haYe gained 
international recognition and Xndergone changes that make the process of listing 
shares less oneroXs, said DreZ Bernstein, co-chairman at MarcXm Bernstein & 
PinchXk, Zhich aXdits Chinese companies in the US. 

 



MeanZhile, US politicians' antipath\ toZard Chinese companies has dXlled the 
allXre of listing in the US. In Ma\, the US Senate passed a bill²primaril\ aimed at 
Chinese companies²that ZoXld ban foreign bXsinesses from US e[changes 
Xnless the\ met stricter aXdit standards. 

Actions b\ the TrXmp administration haYe giYen B\teDance and SenseTime more 
immediate reasons for listing at home. 

President TrXmp is e[pected to sign an e[ecXtiYe order that ZoXld force 
B\teDance to diYest its short-form Yideo-sharing app TikTok, according to reports. 
And last \ear, SenseTime Zas added to the Commerce Department's entit\ list, 
Zhich preYents foreign bXsinesses from trading Zith US companies Xnless the\ 
secXre a license. 

Geopolitical tensions aside, some Chinese companies continXe to receiYe a Zarm 
Zelcome in the US. 

"It's not like Chinese [companies] are jXst coming here. The\'re actXall\ being 
broXght here b\ inYestment banks and other professionals," said Bernstein. "It's 
reall\ a tZo-Za\ street." 

Last Zeek, Chinese electric Yehicle maker Li AXto raised $1.1 billion in its IPO 
after the offering priced aboYe the marketed range. After it began trading 
ThXrsda\ on the Nasdaq, Li AXto's stock ended the Zeek Xp 39%. 
GXang]hoX-based Xpeng Motors also reportedl\ filed confidentiall\ for an IPO in 
the US. 

MeanZhile, a third Chinese EV maker, WM Motor, has opted to consider a STAR 
board IPO, Bloomberg reported. 

The recent stock market sXccess of Tesla, Fisker, China-based Nio and others 
haYe made it clear that inYestors are craYing neZ car makers, said Seth Goldstein, 
an eqXit\ anal\st at Morningstar. 

"The adYisors and CFOs of [EV makers] are looking at that as a Za\ to raise 
capital giYen Zhat seems like mass inYestor appetite to pXrchase shares of a neZ 
EV compan\," he e[plained. 



US e[changes offer Chinese bXsinesses large and diYersified soXrces of capital, 
an attractiYe proposition for its fXll stable of domestic Xnicorns companies, 
Bernstein said. 

China's relatiYe sXccess in controlling the coronaYirXs ma\ also be contribXting to 
the stead\ stream of IPOs for domestic companies. 

"A good part of the Chinese econom\ is open," Bernstein said. "These companies 
noZ haYe a reYenXe stream post-COVID, so to speak, Zhich makes them more 
palatable to go pXblic." 

 


